
District 1 -- LIQUID ASPHALT PRICING

Pricing Period
March 23, 2009 - April 5, 2009 MC-250 MC-800 EA-90 EA-150 EA-300

SS-1
70/30 SS-1 CRS-2 CSS-1 CSS-1H CRS-2P

SCRUB
SEAL

ANDREW
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

ATCHISON
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

BUCHANAN
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

CALDWELL
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -
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District 1 -- LIQUID ASPHALT PRICING

Pricing Period
March 23, 2009 - April 5, 2009 MC-250 MC-800 EA-90 EA-150 EA-300

SS-1
70/30 SS-1 CRS-2 CSS-1 CSS-1H CRS-2P

SCRUB
SEAL

CLINTON
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

DAVIESS
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

DEKALB
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

GENTRY
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -
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District 1 -- LIQUID ASPHALT PRICING

Pricing Period
March 23, 2009 - April 5, 2009 MC-250 MC-800 EA-90 EA-150 EA-300

SS-1
70/30 SS-1 CRS-2 CSS-1 CSS-1H CRS-2P

SCRUB
SEAL

HARRISON
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

HOLT
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

NODAWAY
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -

WORTH
COASTAL ENERGY 3.950 3.900 2.800 2.850 2.900 2.550 2.700 2.700 - - 3.100 -
MISSOURI PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
VANCE BROS 3.890 3.790 2.690 2.790 2.890 2.450 2.490 2.500 2.500 2.500 2.960 No Bid
MARATHON PETROLEUM - - - - - - - - - - - -
SEMMATERIALS - - - - - - - - - - - -
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District 1 -- LIQUID ASPHALT PRICING

Pricing Period
March 23, 2009 - April 5, 2009 MC-250 MC-800 EA-90 EA-150 EA-300

SS-1
70/30 SS-1 CRS-2 CSS-1 CSS-1H CRS-2P

SCRUB
SEAL

VENDOR NAME

Street:

Vendor #:  4312434690  0
INCORPORATED IN STATE OF MISSOURI
MANUFACTURED IN STATE OF MISSOURI

Street:

Vendor #: 4312020200  1
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY OF MISSOURI
MANUFACTURED IN STATE OF MISSOURI

Street:

Vendor #:  44-0577983
INCORPORATED IN STATE OF MISSOURI
MANUFACTURED IN STATE OF MISSOURI

Street:

31-1537655
INCORPORATED IN STATE OF DELAWARE
MANUFACTURED IN STATE OF MISSOURI

PHONE:  1-800-821-8549

PHONE:  1-217-483-6322

PHONE:  314-991-2180 ext 226

VANCE BROTHERS INC. 5201 BRIGHTON - P.O. BOX 300107
City,ST, Zip: KANSAS CITY, MO  64130

PHONE:  800-748-7932, 417-469-2777

MISSOURI PETROLEUM PRODUCTS 1620 WOODSON ROAD
City,ST, Zip: ST. LOUIS, MO  63114

DISTRICT ORDERING INFORMATION

PURCHASE ORDER ADDRESS

COASTAL ENERGY CORPORATION # 1 COASTAL DRIVE, P.O. BOX 218
City,ST, Zip: WILLOW SPRING, MO  65793

MARATHON PETROLEUM COMPANY P. O. BOX 75
City,ST, Zip: CHATHAM , IL  62629
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District 1 -- LIQUID ASPHALT PRICING

Pricing Period
March 23, 2009 - April 5, 2009 MC-250 MC-800 EA-90 EA-150 EA-300

SS-1
70/30 SS-1 CRS-2 CSS-1 CSS-1H CRS-2P

SCRUB
SEAL

SEMMATERIALS CO. Street:
SEDALIA, MO  65301

Vendor #:4312273040 0
INCORPORATED IN STATE OF OKLAHOMA
MANUFACTURED IN STATE OF MISSOURI

PHONE:  660-827-1253

1414 WEST MORGAN
City,ST, Zip:
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