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Thank you for your response to our Request for Bid # D5-10-025B  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were 
received.  This bid was awarded to: CSH Trailers  If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above.     
 
                                                                                                                                       Buyer: Corey Duemmel, Sr. Procurement Agent 
D5-10-025B REQUEST FOR BID: Utility Trailers 
 H.M. Dinzler Equipment Roland Machinery Utility Trailer Co. Tri-State Const. Equip CSH Trailers 
Item 1  
12’ Trailer 
 

 
NO BID 

$3,306.00 
Felling FT-7E 

$2,534.00 
Doolittle  

$5,000.00 
$4,900.00 

CBCT 1210E 

$2,556.00 
$2,517.66 

Loadmaster U1282T7 
Item 2 
14’ Trailer 
 

 
NO BID 

$3,429.00 
Felling FT-7E 

$2,643.00 
Doolittle 

$5,100.00 
$5,000.00 

CBCT 1410E 

$2,612.00 
$2,572.82 

Loadmaster U1482T7 
Item 3 
16’ Trailer 

 
NO BID 

$3,682.00 
Felling FT-7E 

$2,752.00 
Doolittle 

$5,200.00 
$5,100.00 

CBCT 181610E 

$2,668.00 
$2,627.98 

Loadmaster U1682T7 
Item 4 
18’ Trailer 

$6,256.00 
Towmaster 

T-10DD 

$4,923.00 
Felling FT-10E 

$3,811.00 
Doolittle 

$5,450.00 
$5,350.00 

CBCT 1812E 

$3,394.00 
$3,343.09 

Loadmaster U1882T10 
Item 5 
20’ Trailer 

$6,576.00 
Towmaster 

T-10DD 

$5,177.00 
Felling FT-10E 

$4,041.00 
Doolittle 

$5,600.00 
$5,500.00 

CBCT 2012E 

$3,505.00 
$3,452.43 

Loadmaster U2082T10 
Item 6 
22’ Trailer 

$6,895.00 
Towmaster 

T-10DD 

$5,430.00 
Felling FT-10E 

$4,189.00 
Doolittle 

$5,700.00 
$5,600.00 

CBCT2212E 

$3,618.00 
$3,563.73 

Loadmaster 
U2282T10 

Itlilicized prices in blue are the discounted prices if 6 or more trailers are purchased. 
**Mulitple vendors had exceptions to bid specifications 
BOLD indicates low bid 
 



 Verde Inc.  
 

All American Trailer Keyesport Mfg. Pat Kelley Equipment  Vermeer Great Plains  

Item 1  
12’ Trailer  
 

$2,917.00 
DTE8212ER35B 

$3,900.00 
$3,800.00 

UT12-7000 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

Item 2 
14’ Trailer 
 

$3,044.00 
DTE8214ER35B 

$3,960.00 
$3,860.00 

UT14-7000 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

Item 3 
16’ Trailer 
 

$3,171.00 
DTE8216ER35B 

$4,120.00 
$4,020.00 

UT16-7000 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

Item 4 
18’ Trailer 
 

$3,695.00 
DTE8218ER52B 

$4,995.00 
$4,895.00 

UT18-10400 

$6,475.00 
$6,375.00 

Interstate 85T-18 

 
NO BID 

Item 5 
20’ Trailer 
 

$3,845.00 
DTE8220ER52B 

$5,055.00 
$4,955.00 

UT20-10400 

$6,805.00 
$6,705.00 

Interstate 85T-20 

 
NO BID 

Item 6 
22’ Trailer 
 

Irregular 

$4,165.00 
DTE8222ER52B 

$5,115.00 
$5,015.00 

UT22-10400 

$7,135.00 
$7,035.00 

Interstate 85T-22 

 
NO BID 

 
Itlilicized rices in blue are the discounted prices if 6 or more trailers are purchased. 
**Mulitple vendors had exceptions to bid specifications 
BOLD indicates low bid 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Options  
 
 H.M. Dinzler 

Equipment 
Roland Machinery Utility Trailer Co. Tri-State Const. 

Equip 
CSH Trailers 

1 – 6,000# axles 7,000 lb axes are 
standard 

Included  $545.00 Standard  $685.00 

2 – Credit for 
purchase of six (6) 
or more trailers. 

$0 $0 $0 (100.00) (1.5%) 

 
 
 Verde Inc. All American 

Trailer 
Keyesport Mfg. Pat Kelley 

Equipment 
Vermeer Great 

Plains 
1 – 6,000# axles 
 

$600.00 $380.00  Included  NO BID 

2 – Credit for 
purchase of six (6) 
or more trailers. 

$0 $0 ($100.00) ($100.00) NO BID 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
A total of 94 vendors (8 of which were MBE/WBE/DBE vendors) were sent notification of the online posting of this RFQ opportunity.  One 
MBE/WBE/DBE responded.   
 
 
 
 
 



VENDORS 
 
H.M. Dinzler Equipment Co. Inc.       Vermeer Great Plains 
Attn: Tim Glanz          Attn: Paul Havelene         
1320 S. Vandeventer Avenue       15505 S. 169 Hwy 
St. Louis, MO 63110        Olathe, KS 66062         
314-535-2340 PHONE       913-530-7232 PHONE    
314-535-2390 FAX        913-530-7232 CELL         
sales@DinzlerEquipment.com       913-829-6709 FAX        
         paulh@vermeergreatplains.com  
 
Roland Machinery Co.        CSH Trailers  
Attn: Victor Keough         Attn: Stan Heckman 
4670 Crossroads Ind. Dr.        26 CR 511 
Bridgeton, MO 63044        Westphalia, MO 65085  
314-291-1330 PHONE       573-455-2998 PHONE 
314-359-8708 CELL        573-619-4007 CELL 
314-291-8050 FAX        573-455-2787 FAX 
vkeough@rolandmachinery.com        sheckman@cshtrailers.com  
  
Utility Trailer Company        Verde Inc.  
Attn: Bernard Grice         Attn: J.T. Shortly  
6401 W. Highway 40         2300 N. Scenic Hwy  
Columbia, MO 65202        Lake Wales, FL 33898 
573-445-3990 PHONE/FAX       863-559-3434 PHONE 
         863-984-6537 FAX  
Tri-State Const. Equipment       verdeinc@earthlink.net  
Attn: Kevin Smyser     
3787 County Rd. 312        All American Trailer Connection Inc.  
Palmyra, MO 63461         Attn: Shawn Lago  
573-769-2274 PHONE       1102 South Dixie Hwy  
573-248-6455 CELL        Lantana, FL 33462  
573-769-4880 FAX        561-582-1800 PHONE 
Kevin.smyser@meoi.com        561-582-1873 FAX 
         sclago@aatc1.com  
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Keyesport Mfg. 
Attn: Charles Kern  
1610 Mulberry St .  
Keyesport, IL 62253  
618-749-5510 PHONE  
618-749-5572 FAX 
keyesport@frontiernet.net  
 
Pat Kelley Equipment Company  
Attn: Rich Sahrman  
5920 N. Lindbergh Blvd.  
Hazelwood, MO 63042-3124 
314-895-9500 PHONE  
314-305-0490 CELL 
314-895-4474 FAX  
sales@patkelley.com       
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