SINGLE AXLE PRICE AND INFORMATION

Midway Sterling - Western Star
w/Henderson

Midway Sterling - Western Star
w/Viking Cives

Navistar Acceptable -
International w/Henderson

Navistar Acceptable - International
w/Monroe

Navistar Acceptable -
International w/Viking Cives

Navistar Preferred -

International w/Henderson

Navistar Preferred -
International w/Monroe

Navistar Preferred -
International w/Viking

Navistar Innovative -
International w/Viking

Truck Centers Inc.,
Freightliner w/Henderson

Truck Centers Inc., Freightliner
w/Monroe

Description Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Single Axle Cab and Chassis $88,163.00 $88,163.00 $64,475.00 $64,475.00 $66,409.00 $67,496.00 $67,496.00 $67,496.00 $75,182.00 $81,121.00 NOT PURCHASED
Single Axle Corten V-Style Long Sill Dump Body $46,252.00 $45,340.00 $44,905.00 $49,950.00 $45,140.00 $46,252.00 $52,423.00 $45,140.00 $45,140.00 $46,252.00 NOT PURCHASED
Single Axle Stainless Steel I-Beam Long Sill dump Body $48,472.00 $47,462.00 $47,060.00 $53,630.00 $47,262.00 $48,472.00 $56,285.00 $47,262.00 $47,262.00 $48,472.00 NOT PURCHASED
Single Axle Extended Warranty Option #1 $3,943.00 $3,943.00 $2,160.00 $2,160.00 $2,268.00 $2,268.00 $2,268.00 $2,268.00 [Included in Base $2,626.50 NOT PURCHASED
Option Description Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Right and/or Left Hand Wing Plow $8,940.00 $8,922.00 $8,680.00 $8,538.00 $8,922.00 $8,940.00 $8,961.00 $8,922.00 $8,922.00 $8,940.00 NOT PURCHASED
Underbody Scraper (For Crew Cab Only) $11,301.00 $10,890.00 $10,972.00 $10,735.00 $10,890.00 $11,301.00 $11,266.00 $10,890.00 $10,890.00 $11,301.00 NOT PURCHASED
10" Skid Mounted Material Spreader $8,837.00 $9,390.00 $8,580.00 $9,797.00 $9,390.00 $8,837.00 $10,282.00 $9,390.00 $9,390.00 $8,837.00 NOT PURCHASED
10" Skid Mounted Material Spreader with Auger $9,643.00 $10,191.00 $9,362.00 $9,895.00 $10,191.00 $9,643.00 $10,385.00 $10,191.00 $10,191.00 $9,643.00 NOT PURCHASED
6 Speed Manual Transmission ($5,338.00) ($5,338.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) N/A N/A NOT PURCHASED
Pavement Temperature Sensor $1,471.00 $1,398.00 $1,428.00 $1,516.00 $1,398.00 $1,471.00 $1,591.00 $1,398.00 $1,398.00 $1,471.00 NOT PURCHASED
Exhaust Brake Engine Retarder $2,209.00 $2,209.00  |$425 Exhaust Brake/$790 $425 Exhaust Brake/$790 $430 Exhaust Brake/$805 $425 Exhaust Brake/$790 $425 Exhaust Brake/$790 $425 Exhaust Brake/$790 $425 Exhaust Brake or $790 $1,375.00 NOT PURCHASED
Compression Brake Compression Brake Compression Brake Compression Brake Compression Brake Compression Brake Compression Brake
Automatic Tire Chains $1,963.00 $1,843.00 $1,906.00 $2,061.00 $1,843.00 $1,963.00 $2,163.00 $1,843.00 $1,843.00 $1,963.00 NOT PURCHASED
Dual Steering $0.00 $0.00 $7,800.00 $7,800.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $9,446.00 NOT PURCHASED
Dump Body Vibrator |$939.00 $813.00 $912.00 $802.00 $813.00 $939.00 $842.00 $813.00 $813.00 039 $939.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Left-/Right-hand Truck Mounted Attenuator Pockets $883.00 $367.00 $857.00 $175.00 $367.00 $883.00 $184.00 $367.00 $367.00 883 $883.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Cummins ISL9 Engine $0.00 $0.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 STD STD NOT PURCHASED
Bluetooth Hands-free Technology $300.00 $300.00 $650.00 $650.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $156.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Passenger Door Peep Window $168.00 $168.00 $800.00 $800.00 $840.00 $840.00 $840.00 $840.00 $840.00 $160.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Tank Heater $438.00 $438.00 $650.00 $650.00 $670.00 $670.00 $670.00 $670.00 Included in base N/A NOT PURCHASED
Removal of Base Pre-Wet System from base unit ($2,072.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,072.00) $975.00 ($1,235.00) ($2,072.00) $1023.00 ($1,235.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,072.00) NOT PURCHASED
Add 25 GPM Pre-Wet per 2.6.5.0 $973.00 $895.00 $945.00 $875.00 $895.00 $973.00 $918.00 $895.00 $895.00 $973.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Receiver Pintle Hitch per 2.6.5.r $75.00 $434.00 $73.00 $156.00 $434.00 $75.00 $164.00 $434.00 $434.00 $75.00  [NOT PURCHASED
Walk Rail for Stainless Steel Bed $705.00 $607.00 $684.00 $560.00 $607.00 $705.00 $588.00 $607.00 $607.00 $705.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Walk Rail for Corten Steel Bed $522.00 $458.00 $507.00 $350.00 $463.00 $522.00 $367.00 $463.00 $463.00 $522.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Back Up Camera and Display $620.00 $713.00 $602.00 $944.00 $605.00 $620.00 $991.00 $605.00 $605.00 $620.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Installation of MoDOT owned 50 Watt radio $192.00 $128.00 $242.00 $466.00 $173.00 $237.00 $534.00 $173.00 $137.50 $192.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Installation of MoDOT owned 100 Watt radio $192.00 $143.00 $242.00 $466.00 $188.00 $237.00 $534.00 $188.00 $154.00 $192.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Heated Windshield $425.00 $425.00 $480.00 $480.00 $494.00 $494.00 $494.00 $494.00 $494.00 $389.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Vibrating Wiper Blades $236.00 $240.00 $229.00 $282.00 $240.00 $236.00 $296.00 $240.00 $240.00 $236.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Lug Nut Torque Indicator $69.00 $30.00 $67.00 $177.00 No Bid $69.00 $186.00 No Bid No Bid $69.00  [NOT PURCHASED
Tire Pressure Monitoring System $1,333.00 $1,333.00 $1,527.00 $1527.00 No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid N/A NOT PURCHASED
Air Control Operated Tarp $1,130.00 $780.00 $1097.00 $125.00 $780.00 $1,130.00 $131.00 $780.00 $780.00 $1,130.00 NOT PURCHASED
Air Operated Hydraulic Joy Stick Control Lever $0.00 $245.00 $0.00 $200.00 $245.00 0 $0.00 $210.00 $245.00 $245.00 $0.00 NOT PURCHASED
Air Control Operated Tail Gate Latch $0.00 $66.00 $0.00 $50.00 $66.00 0 $0.00 $52.00 $66.00 $66.00 $0.00 NOT PURCHASED
Air Control Operated Tire Chains $1,963.00 $66.00 $1906.00 $75.00 $66.00 $1,963.00 $79.00 $66.00 $66.00 $1,906.00 NOT PURCHASED
Additional Training Modules $0.00 $0.00 Navistar $3,000 12Hrs Navistar $3,000 12Hrs Navistar $3,000 12Hrs Navistar $3,000 12Hrs Navistar $3,000 12Hrs Navistar $3,000 12Hrs Navistar $3,000 12Hrs $0.00 NOT PURCHASED
Installation of MoDOT Provided Decals $122.00 $36.00 $118.00 $45.00 $36.00 $122.00 $47.00 $36.00 $36.00 $122.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Shovel Tool Box $768.00 $822.00 $746.00 $972.00 $822.00 $768.00 $1020.00 $822.00 $822.00 $768.00 [NOT PURCHASED
Stainless Steel Spring Loaded Shovel Bracket $41.00 $49.00 $40.00 $73.00 $49.00 $41.00 $77.00 $49.00 $49.00 $41.00  [NOT PURCHASED
Crew Cab Option N/A N/A N/A N/A $5,929.00 $5,929.00 $6,225.00 $6,225.00 $6,225.00 $6,225.00 $6,225.00 [N/A NOT PURCHASED
Remove base spreader control and replace with Rexroth CS 550/150 Spreader /Joy ($1,630.00) ($654.00)  [No bid ($1630.00) No Bid No bid ($654.00)  [No bid ($1,630.00) [No Bid No bid ($654.00) ($654.00) ($1,630.00) NOT PURCHASED
Stick Controller.per Section 2.6.5.jj.
10-foot Spreader Stand $1,717.00 $2,117.00 $1,667.00 $2,480.00 $2,117.00 $1,717.00 $2,603.00 $2,117.00 $2,117.00 $1,717.00 NOT PURCHASED
Remove base spreader control and replace with Force America CAN Bus Spreader $1,767.00 $2,953.00 $1,716.00 ($2,188.00) $2,953.00 $1,767.00 ($2,188.00) $2,953.00 $2953.00 $1,767.00 NOT PURCHASED
Control System
Remove base spreader control and replace with Cirus Controls SpreadSmart RX ($804.00) $1,293.00 $804.00 ($1,475.00) $1,293.00 ($804.00) ($1,475.00) $1,293.00 $1293.00 ($804.00) [INOT PURCHASED
CAN Bus Spreader Control System
Single Axle Air Ride Suspension ($253.00) ($253.00) $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $176.96 [NOT PURCHASED
Single Axle Contractor Bed with Drop Down Sides $29,169.00 $48,878.00 $28,320.00 $46,435.00 $48,878.00 $29,170.00 $48,734.00 $48,878.00 $48,878.00 $29,170.00 NOT PURCHASED




SINGLE AXLE PRICE AND INFORMATION Truck Centers Inc., Freightliner | Vanguard Truck Center Mack Vanguard Truck Center Mack Vanguard Truck Center Mack Vanguard Truck Center Mack | Vanguard Truck Center Mack | Vanguard Truck Center Mack |Westfall GMC Mack MHD GU4 | Westfall GMC Mack MHD GU4 |Westfall GMC Mack MHD GU4
w/Viking Cives Granite GU4 w/Henderson Granite GU7 w/Henderson Granite GU4 w/Monroe Granite GU7 w/Monroe Granite GU4 w/Viking Cives Granite GU7 w/Viking Cives  |w/Henderson w/Monroe w/Viking-Cives
Description Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Single Axle Cab and Chassis $81,121.00 $89,174.00 $91,224.00 $89,174.00 $91,224.00 $89,174.00 $91,224.00 $87,084.00 $87,084.00 |$87,151.00
Single Axle Corten V-Style Long Sill Dump Body $45,340.00 $46,252.00 $46,252.00 $52,423.00 $52,423.00 $45,340.00 $45,340.00 $46,252.00 $48,541.00 |$45,340.00
Single Axle Stainless Steel I-Beam Long Sill dump Body $47,462.00 $48,472.00 $48,472.00 $56,285.00 $56,285.00 $47,462.00 $47,462.00 $48,472.00 $50,871.00 |$47,462.00
Single Axle Extended Warranty Option #1 $2,626.50 $3,126.00 $4,865.00 $3,126.00 $4,865.00 $3,126.00 $4,865.00 $3,552.00 $3,552.00 |$3,552.00
Option Description Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Right and/or Left Hand Wing Plow $8,922.00 $8,940.00 $8,940.00 $8,961.00 $8,961.00 $8,922.00 $8,922.00 $8,940.00 $9,383.00 |$8,922.00
Underbody Scraper (For Crew Cab Only) $10,890.00 $11,301.00 $11,301.00 $11,266.00 $11,266.00 $10,890.00 $10,890.00 $11,301.00 $11,860.00 |$10,191.00
10" Skid Mounted Material Spreader $9,390.00 $8,837.00 $8,837.00 $10,282.00 $10,282.00 $9,390.00 $9,390.00 $8,837.00 $9,274.00  |$9,390.00
10" Skid Mounted Material Spreader with Auger $10,195.00 $9,643.00 $9,643.00 $10,385.00 $10,385.00 $10,142.00 $10,142.00 $9,643.00 $10,120.00 |$10,195.00
6 Speed Manual Transmission N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Pavement Temperature Sensor $1,398.00 $1,471.00 $1,471.00 $1,591.00 $1,591.00 $1,398.00 $1,398.00 $1,471.00 $1,544.00 [$1,398.00
Exhaust Brake Engine Retarder $1,375.00 $301.00 $301.00 $301.00 $301.00 $301.00 $301.00 $208.00 $208.00 $208.00)
Automatic Tire Chains $1,843.00 $1,963.00 $1,963.00 $2,163.00 $2,163.00 $1,843.00 $1,843.00 $1,963.00 $2,060.00 [$1,843.00
Dual Steering $9,446.00  [Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available N/A N/A N/A
Dump Body Vibrator $813.00 $939.00 $939.00 $842.00 $842.00 $813.00 $813.00 $939.00 $985.00 $813.00)
Left-/Right-hand Truck Mounted Attenuator Pockets $367.00 $883.00 $883.00 $184.00 $184.00 $367.00 $367.00 $883.00 $927.00 $367.00)
Cummins ISL9 Engine STD Included Not Available Included Not Available Included Not Available STANDARD STANDARD Standard
Bluetooth Hands-free Technology $156.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 STANDARD STANDARD Standard
Passenger Door Peep Window $160.00 Included Included Included Included Included Included STANDARD STANDARD Standard
Tank Heater N/A Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available $300.00 $300.00 $300.00]
Removal of Base Pre-Wet System from base unit ($1,260.00) ($2,072.00) ($2,072.00) $1023.00 $1023.00 ($1,235.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,072.00) $1023.00 |($1,235.00)
Add 25 GPM Pre-Wet per 2.6.5.0 $895.00 $973.00 $973.00 $918.00 $918.00 $895.00 $895.00 $973.00 $918.00 $895.00)
Receiver Pintle Hitch per 2.6.5.r $434.00 $75.00 $75.00 $165.00 $164.00 $434.00 $434.00 $75.00 $164.00 $434.00)
Walk Rail for Stainless Steel Bed $607.00 $705.00 $705.00 $588.00 $588.00 $607.00 $607.00 $705.00 $588.00 $607.00)
Walk Rail for Corten Steel Bed $463.00 $522.00 $522.00 $367.00 $367.00 $456.00 $456.00 $522.00 $367.00 $485.00)
Back Up Camera and Display $713.00 $620.00 $620.00 $91.00 $991.00 $605.00 $605.00 $620.00 $991.00 $605.00)
Installation of MoDOT owned 50 Watt radio $128.00 $192.00 $192.00 $430.00 $430.00 $128.00 $128.00 $192.00 $430.00 $128.00)
Installation of MoDOT owned 100 Watt radio $143.00 $192.00 $192.00 $430.00 $430.00 $143.00 $143.00 $192.00 $430.00 $143.00)
Heated Windshield $389.00 $421.00 $421.00 $421.00 $421.00 $421.00 $421.00 $290.00 $290.00 $290.00)
Vibrating Wiper Blades $240.00 $236.00 $236.00 Not Available Not Available $240.00 $240.00 $236.00 N/A $240.00)
Lug Nut Torque Indicator $180.00 $69.00 $69.00 $186.00 $186.00 $120.00 $120.00 $69.00 $186.00 $129.00)
Tire Pressure Monitoring System N/A $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 N/A N/A N/A
Air Control Operated Tarp $780.00 $1,130.00 $1,130.00 $131.00 $131.00 $780.00 $780.00 $1,130.00 $131.00 $780.00)
Air Operated Hydraulic Joy Stick Control Lever $245.00 $0.00 $0.00 $210.00 $210.00 $245.00 $245.00 $0.00 $210.00 $245.00)
Air Control Operated Tail Gate Latch $66.00 $0.00 $0.00 $52.00 $52.00 $66.00 $66.00 $0.00 $52.00 $66.00]
Air Control Operated Tire Chains $66.00 $1,963.00 $1,963.00 $79.00 $79.00 $66.00 $66.00 $1,963.00 $79.00 $66.00|
Additional Training Modules $200.00 $308.00 $308.00 $308/$616 $308/$616 $308/$204 $308/$204 $0.00
Installation of MoDOT Provided Decals $36.00 $122.00 $122.00 $47.00 $47.00 $36.00 $36.00 $122.00 $47.00 $36.00]
Shovel Tool Box $822.00 $768.00 $768.00 $1020.00 $1020.00 $822.00 $822.00 $768.00 $1020.00 $822.00)
Stainless Steel Spring Loaded Shovel Bracket $49.00 $41.00 $41.00 $77.00 $77.00 $49.00 $49.00 $41.00 $77.00 $49.00]
Crew Cab Option N/A Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available Not Available N/A N/A N/A
Remove base spreader control and replace with Rexroth CS 550/150 Spreader /Joy ($667.00) ($1,630.00) ($1,630.00)0 [NOBID NO BID ($654.00) ($654.00) ($1,630.00) (NOBID ($654.00),
Stick Controller.per Section 2.6.5.jj.
10-foot Spreader Stand $2,117.00 $1,717.00 $1,717.00 $2,603.00 $2,603.00 $2,117.00 $2,117.00 $1,717.00 $2,603.00 [$2,117.00
Remove base spreader control and replace with Force America CAN Bus Spreader $2,953.00 $1,767.00 $1,767.00 ($2,188.00) ($2,188.00) $2,953.00 $2,953.00 $1,767.00 ($2,188.00) |$2,953.00
Control System
Remove base spreader control and replace with Cirus Controls SpreadSmart RX $1,293.00 ($804.00) ($804.00) ($1,475.00) ($1,475.00) $1,293.00 $1,293.00 ($804.00) ($1,475.00) |$1,293.00
CAN Bus Spreader Control System
Single Axle Air Ride Suspension $162.74 $751.00 $751.00 $751.00 | $751.00 $751.00 $751.00 $669.00 $ $669.00 $669.00)
Single Axle Contractor Bed with Drop Down Sides $48,878.00 $29,170.00 $29,170.00 $48,734.00 | $48,734.00 $48,790.00 $48,790.00 $29,170.00 $48,734.00 [$48,878.00




