
Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126  Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Altorfer, Inc COOP - YES
3520 Moberly Ave.
Hannibal, MO  63401
Contact:  Chris Akright
Phone #:  (573) 248-7942
cakright@aotorfer.com

*****  Service area includes these counties:  Schuyler, Scotland, Clark, Adair, Knox, Lewis, Macon, Shelby, Marion, 
Randolph, Monroe, Ralls, Pike

Standard Warranty:  12 months / 1500 Hours Total Machine
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Extended Warranty:  36 months / 3000 Hours Total Machine
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 216B2
Base Price: $24,342

Option 1  Cold planer:    PC203  $9,151
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

 



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 226B2
Base Price: $27,354

Option 1  Cold planer:    $9,151
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 232B2
Base Price: $26,750

Option 1  Cold planer:    $10,821  (PC204)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 242B2
Base Price: $31,054

Option 1  Cold planer:    $11,949  (PC205)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 247B2
Base Price: $34,013

Option 1  Cold planer:    $10,821  (PC204)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 257B2
Base Price: $37,560

Option 1  Cold planer:    $11,949  (PC205)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 236B2
Base Price: $29,042

Option 1  Cold planer:    $10,821  (PC204)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 246C
Base Price: $33,791

Option 1  Cold planer:    $14,785  (PC206)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 252B2
Base Price: $32,076

Option 1  Cold planer:    $10,821  (PC204)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 256C
Base Price: $36,176

Option 1  Cold planer:    $14,785  (PC206)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 262C
Base Price: $37,589

Option 1  Cold planer:    $19,373  (PC210)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 277C
Base Price: $51,040

Option 1  Cold planer:    $19,373  (PC210)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 287C
Base Price: $54,028

Option 1  Cold planer:    $19,373 
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 279C
Base Price: $50,618

Option 1  Cold planer:    $17,785  (PC206) 
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 289C
Base Price: $53,615

Option 1  Cold planer:    $19,373
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 272C
Base Price: $41,861

Option 1  Cold planer:    $19,373 (PC210)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 297C
Base Price: $60,279

Option 1  Cold planer:    $19,373 (PC210)
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower                   

Make & Model:   Cat 299C
Base Price: $59,161

Option 1  Cold planer:    $19,373 
Option 2  Training Modules: $150 per student with an 8 student minimum

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126  Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Bobcat Company COOP - YES
250 East Beaton Drive
West Fargo,  ND  58078-6000
Contact:  Mike Kotzbacher
Phone #:  (701) 241-8700
mike.kotzbacher@doosan.com

*****  Service area includes:  Statewide

Standard Warranty:  12 months
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Extended Warranty:  Protection Plus
Begin Date:  After standard 12-month warranty expires

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 25 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S70
Base Price: $12,061

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
 for pricing 

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $100  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after 
receipt of order.



Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 35 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S100 Bobcat T110
Base Price: $14,545 $22,851

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
 for pricing 

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $100  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after 
receipt of order.

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S130 Bobcat S150 Bobcat S175
Base Price: $16,690 $17,813 $18,586

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
 for pricing 

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $100  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after 
receipt of order.



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S160 Bobcat S185 Bobcat S205
Base Price: $19,497 $20,793 $21,457

Bobcat T180 Bobcat T190
$29,199 $31,027

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
 for pricing 

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $100  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after 
receipt of order.

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S630 Bobcat S250 Bobcat S650
Base Price: $22,695 $25,190 $23,946

Bobcat T630 Bobcat T650
$33,133 $35,076

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
 for pricing 

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $100  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after 
receipt of order.





Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S300 Bobcat T300 Bobcat A300
Base Price: $27,741 $41,035 $37,967

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
 for pricing 

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $100  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after 
receipt of order.

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S330 Bobcat T320
Base Price: $30,775 $43,212

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
 for pricing 

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $100  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after 
receipt of order.



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Crown Power and Equipment COOP - YES
1881 Prathersville Road
Columbia,  MO  65202
Contact:  Jon Lafoy
Phone #:  (573) 443-4541
jlafoy@crown-power.com

*****  Service area includes:  Statewide

Standard Warranty:  One Year Full.   No Hour Limitation
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Extended Warranty:  Two Year Full Extended $0 Deductable
Model 410 Total 3 Years Full Warranty  $1,725
Model 420 Total 3 Years Full Warranty  $1,857
Model 430 Total 3 Years Full Warranty  $2,074
Model 440 Total 3 Years Full Warranty  $2,200
Model 450 Total 3 Years Full Warranty  $2,850
Model 420CTL  Total 3 Years Full Warranty  $3,588
Model 440CTL  Total 3 Years Full Warranty  $3,980
Model 450CTL  Total 3 Years Full Warranty  $6,100
4 and 5 Year Deductable Upon Request

Begin Date:  On Delivery

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower                  NO BID



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 410SSL
Base Price: $21,638

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $0  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-90 days after 
receipt of order.

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 420SSL Case 420CTL
Base Price: $23,688 $36,120

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $0  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-90 days after 
receipt of order.



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 430SSL
Base Price: $25,688

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $0  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-90 days after 
receipt of order.

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 440SSL Case 440CTL Case 450SSL Case 450CTL
Base Price: $27,020 $41,573 $30,570 $50,573

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $0  
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing 
Guide Options:  0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-90 days after 
receipt of order.



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Dean Machinery Co COOP - YES, but only in 40-county Cat territory.   
5701 E. 87th Street Call vendor for details.
Kansas City,  MO  64132-3071
Contact:  Steven C. Phillips
Phone #:  (816) 753-5300
steve.phillips@deancat.com

*****  Service area includes:  Statewide

Standard Warranty:  12 mos or 1500 Hrs., whichever comes first. Full Machine; Parts & Labor
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Extended Warranty:    Full, 36 mo./3,000 Hrs., whichever comes first. Powertrain Only; Parts & Labor
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 216B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 203 (14")
Base Price: $23,817 $9,052

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 226B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 205 (18")
Base Price: $26,661 $11,949

Cat 232B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 204 (18")
$26,122 $10,821

Cat 242B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 205 (18")
$30,361 $11,949

Cat 247B2 (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 204 (18")
$33,385 $10,821

Cat 257B2 (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 205 (18")
$36,867 $11,949

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 246C (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 206 (24")
Base Price: $33,217 $14,785

Cat 236B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 204 (18")
$26,142 $10,821

Cat 252B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 204 (18")
$31,448 $10,821

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 256C (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 206 (24")
Base Price: $35,318 $14,785

Cat 262C (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$36,465 $19,373

Cat 277C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 206 (24")
$50,182 $14,785

Cat 287C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$52,904 $19,373

Cat 279C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 206 (24")
$49,760 $14,785

Cat 289C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$52,491 $19,373

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 272C (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
Base Price: $40,737 $19,373

Cat 297C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$59,155 $19,373

Cat 299C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$58,037 $19,373

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Fabick / Cat COOP - YES, but only in 40-county Cat territory.   
7050 Partnership Prkwy Call vendor for details.
Jefferson City,  MO  65101
Contact:  Benny Walker
Phone #:  (573) 619-0202
bwalker@fabickcat.com

*****  Service area includes:  Statewide

Standard Warranty:  12 mos or 1500 Hrs., whichever comes first. Full Machine; Parts & Labor
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Extended Warranty:    Full, 36 mo./3,000 Hrs., whichever comes first. Powertrain Only; Parts & Labor
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 216B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 203 (14")
Base Price: $23,817 $9,052

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 226B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 205 (18")
Base Price: $26,661 $11,949

Cat 232B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 204 (18")
$26,122 $10,821

Cat 242B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 205 (18")
$30,361 $11,949

Cat 247B2 (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 204 (18")
$33,385 $10,821

Cat 257B2 (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 205 (18")
$36,867 $11,949

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 246C (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 206 (24")
Base Price: $33,217 $14,785

Cat 236B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 204 (18")
$26,142 $10,821

Cat 252B2 (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 204 (18")
$31,448 $10,821

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 256C (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 206 (24")
Base Price: $35,318 $14,785

Cat 262C (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$36,465 $19,373

Cat 277C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 206 (24")
$50,182 $14,785

Cat 287C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$52,904 $19,373

Cat 279C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 206 (24")
$49,760 $14,785

Cat 289C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$52,491 $19,373

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 272C (wheel) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
Base Price: $40,737 $19,373

Cat 297C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$59,155 $19,373

Cat 299C (track) Option 1:  Cold planer:  Caterpillar PC 210 (40")
$58,037 $19,373

Option 2:   Training Modules:  At MoDOT facility:  $1,200 with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  9%

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Logan Contractors Supply COOP - YES
1325 S. Enterprise Dr Logan Contractors Supply

Olathe,  KS  66061 1325 S. Enterprise Dr

Contact:  Jon Krueger Olathe,  KS  66061

Phone #:  (913) 768-1551 Contact:  Jon Krueger

jon@logancontractors.com Phone #:  (913) 768-1551

jon@logancontractors.com

*****  Service area includes:  Districts 1, 4, 7

Standard Warranty:  12 mos. Parts & Labor, 24 mos. Engine
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Extended Warranty:    Contact vendor or Warren Blanchard for Power Protection Plan details
Begin Date:  After Standard Warranty

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl 1640E
Base Price: $15,390

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Not available

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl 3640E w/ Bucket 60"
Base Price: $16,960

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   $10,100

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl 4240E w/ Bucket 62"
Base Price: $18,350

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   $10,100  12" Cutting Width   $10,100

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl 4640E III w/ Bucket 66"
Base Price: $22,100

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   $10,100  12" Cutting Width   $10,100

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl 5240 w/ Bucket 66"
Base Price: $23,200

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   $10,100  12" Cutting Width   $10,100

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl CTL-65 Track Loader w/ Bucket 66"
Base Price: $34,800

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   $10,100  12" Cutting Width   $10,100

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  15%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-45 days after receipt of order

Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl 5640E III w/ Bucket 70"
Base Price: $25,670

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   $10,100  12" Cutting Width   $10,100

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl CTL-75 Track Loader w/ Bucket 74"
Base Price: $43,805

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   $10,100  12" Cutting Width   $10,100

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl 6640E III w/ Bucket 74" Gehl V270 w/ Bucket 70"
Base Price: $28,100 $29,950

Gehl 7810E 
$39,485

Option 1:  Cold planer for 6640E and Gehl V270:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   12" Cutting Width  $10,100

Option 1:  Cold planer for 7810E:  Coneqtec AP 1000 III   40" Cutting Width   $17,100
(Hi-Flow Required for AP1000)

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl CTL-85 Track Loader w/ Bucket 84"
Base Price: $52,700

Option 1:  Cold planer:  Coneqtec AP 300 III   $10,100  12" Cutting Width   $10,100

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: John Deere Company COOP - YES
1515 5th Ave
Moline, IL   61265
Contact:  Sheri Kerr
Phone #:  (309) 765-0260
KerrSheriA@JohnDeere.com

*****  Service area includes:  Statewide

Standard Warranty:  12 mos. Full Machine
Begin Date:  On Delivery

Extended Warranty:    Cost is variable depending on model, type, and time of coverage requested
 

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower                  NO BID



Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 315 (wheel)
Base Price: $20,172.88

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP12C $7,929.60

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  28%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 315 (track)
Base Price: $32,579.56

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP12C $8,281.38

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 318D (wheel) JD 320D (wheel)
Base Price: $22,747.61 $25,102.11

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP12C $7,929.60

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  28%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 319D (track) JD 323D (wheel)
Base Price: $35,562.98 $38,974.82

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP12C $8,783.20

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 326D (wheel)
Base Price: $27,418.72

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP12C $7,929.60

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  28%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 328D (wheel)
Base Price: $29,689.60

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP12C $7,929.60

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  28%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 329D (track)
Base Price: $48,418.81

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP18C $15,119.20

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 332D (wheel)
Base Price: $35,009.37

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP18C $13,635.00

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  28%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 333D (track)
Base Price: $54,034.81

Option 1:  Cold planer:  CP18C $15,119.20

Option 2:   Training Modules:  Contact vendor for additional training options

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Luby Equipment COOP - YES
2300 Cassens Dr.
Fenton,  MO  63026
Contact:  Jerry Jansen
Phone #:  (636) 343-9970
jjansen@lubyepuipment.com

*****  Service area includes:  Districts 3, 6, and 10

Standard Warranty:  One Year Full Machine. Two Year/2000 Hour Engine
Begin Date:  Date of warranty registration

Extended Warranty:  Please contact vendor for details

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL220, ROPS Takeuchi TL220C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
Base Price: $30,500 (includes base bucket) $34,000 (includes base bucket)

Option 1:  Cold planer    Not available

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 410 Series 3
Base Price: $22,250

Option 1:  Cold planer    Not available

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 420 Series 3 Case 420CT Series 3 (track)
Base Price: $24,300 $36,800

Takeuchi TL230, ROPS Takeuchi TL230C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
$34,900 (includes base bucket) $39,150 (includes base bucket)

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery for Case equipment will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Delivery for Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 430 Series 3 Case 435 Series 3 Case 445 Series 3
Base Price: $26,300 $29,000 $32,500

Case 440 Series 3 Case 450 Series 3 Case 465 Series 3
$27,700 $31,250 $38,250

Case 445CT Series 3 (track) Case 440CT Series 3 (track)
$49,500 $42,500

Case 450CT Series 3 (track) Takeuchi TL240, ROPS
$51,500 $42,150 (includes base bucket)

Takeuchi TL240C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
$46,700 (includes base bucket)

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery for Case equipment will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Delivery for Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL250, ROPS Takeuchi TL250C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
Base Price: $51,450 (includes base bucket) $55,760 (includes base bucket)

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery for Case equipment will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Delivery for Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order





Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Pat Kelly Equipment Co. COOP - YES
5920 N. Lindbergh Blvd.
Hazelwood,  MO  63042-3124
Contact:  Rich Sahrman
Phone #:  (314) 895-9500
sales@patkelly.com

*****  Service area includes:  Statewide

Standard Warranty:  12 months, Unlimited Hours
Begin Date:  Day of Delivery

Extended Warranty:  Please contact vendor for details

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L150 w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $19,573

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 34%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L160 w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $20,957

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 34%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L170 w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $21,276

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 34%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L175 w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $22,827

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 34%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L180 w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $25,218

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 34%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C175 Track Loader w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $35,839

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 26%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L185 w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $26,719

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 34%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C185 Track Loader w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $45,609

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 26%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L190 w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $29,693

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 34%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C190 Track Loader w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $48,238

Option 1:  Cold planer    Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $1000 per student with a 1 minimum class size 

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options:  New Holland 26%
Paladin options 23% and priced F.O.B. factory

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name: Victor L Phillips Co COOP - YES
4100 Gardner Avenue
Kansas City,  MO  64120
Contact:  Greg Knipp
Phone #:  (816) 803-9550
gknipp@vlpco.com

*****  Service area includes:  Districts 1, 2, 3, 4, 7, and 8

Standard Warranty:  Case Equipment 12 Months / Unlimited Hours, Engines 24 Months / 2000 Hours

Standard Warranty:  Takeuchi Equipment  24 Months / 2000 Hours

Begin Date:  Upon Delivery

Extended Warranty:  Please contact vendor for details

Item #1:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #2:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower                  NO BID

Item #3:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 410 Series 3
Base Price: $20,712

Takeuchi TL220, ROPS Takeuchi TL220C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
$29,294.09 $33,537.78

Option 1:  Cold planer    Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for information

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $75 per student with a minimum class size of 7

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 38%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery of Case equipment will be made approximately 45-60 days after receipt of order

Delivery of Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Item #4:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 420 Series 3
Base Price: $22,775.79

Option 1:  Cold planer    Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for information

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $75 per student with a minimum class size of 7

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 38%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery of Case equipment will be made approximately 45-60 days after receipt of order

Item #5:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 430 Series 3 Case 435 Series 3 Case 445 Series 3
Base Price: $24,189.25 $26,484.36 $29,585.60

Case 420CT Series 3 (track) Takeuchi TL230, ROPS
$35,182.48 $34,314.67

Takeuchi TL230C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
$38,665.24

Option 1:  Cold planer    Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for information

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $75 per student with a minimum class size of 7

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 38%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery of Case equipment will be made approximately 45-60 days after receipt of order

Delivery of Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Item #6:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case 440 Series 3 Case 450 Series 3 Case 465 Series 3
Base Price: $25,623.38 $29,153.85 $36,100.80

Case 445CT Series 3 (track) Case 440CT Series 3 (track)
$47,482.65 $40,718.90

Case 450CT Series 3 (track)
$50,438.77

Option 1:  Cold planer    Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for information

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $75 per student with a minimum class size of 7

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 38%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery of Case equipment will be made approximately 45-60 days after receipt of order

Delivery of Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #7:  One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL240, ROPS Takeuchi TL240C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
Base Price: $41,306.67 $45,968.00

Takeuchi TL250, ROPS Takeuchi TL250C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
$50,629.33 $55,057.60

Takeuchi TL250CH, High Flow 
$57,232.89

Option 1:  Cold planer    Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for information

Option 2:   Training Modules:  $75 per student with a minimum class size of 7

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 38%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery of Case equipment will be made approximately 45-60 days after receipt of order

Delivery of Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order


