
  not purchased

 
N/A  

 STD

N/A

N/A

Truck Center 
Freightliner 

w/Henderson

Truck Center Freightliner 
w/Monroe 1

Truck Center Freightliner 
w/Viking 1

Tandem Axle Cab and Chassis $97,735.00 $97,735.00 $82,096.00 $82,096.00 $82,096.00 $84,095.00 $84,095.00 $84,095.00 $88,170.00 $91,973.00 $92,992.00
$48,726.00 $48,801.00 $53,322.00 $48,726.00 $48,988.00

TANDEM AXLE PRICE AND INFORMATION MidWay w/Henderson Midway w/Viking Navistar Acceptable 
w/Henderson

Navistar Acceptable 
w/Monroe

Navistar Acceptable 
w/Viking

Navistar Preferred 
w/Henderson

Navistar Preferred 
w/Monroe

Navistar Preferred 
w/Viking

Navistar Innovative 
w/Viking

$48,801.00 not purchased $48,926.00

not purchased $2,626.50
Tandem Axle Stainless Steel I-Beam Long Sill dump Body $51,321.00 $51,381.00 $51,322.00 $58,370.00 $51,181.00 $51,322.00 $58,370.00 $51,181.00
Tandem Axle Corten V-Style Long Sill Dump Body $48,801.00 $48,926.00 $48,801.00 $53,322.00

$8,961.00 $8,922.00 $8,940.00 $8,961.00 $8,922.00 $8,917.00

$51,322.00 not purchased $51,381.00
Tandem Axle Extended Warranty Option #1 $3,943.00 $3,943.00 $3,019.50 $3,019.50 $3,019.50 $3,019.50 $3,019.50 $3,019.50 Included in Base $2,626.50

$8,940.00 not purchased $8,922.00
HD Right Hand 3 Function Front Mount Wing Plow $12,123.00 $12,627.00 $12,123.00 $13,584.00 $12,534.00 $12,123.00 $13,584.00 $12,534.00 $12,434.00 $12,123.00 not purchased $12,627.00
Right and/or Left Hand Wing Plow $8,940.00 $8,922.00 $8,940.00

not purchased $12,041.00
Underbody Scraper $11,301.00 $10,890.00 $11,301.00 $11,266.00 $10,890.00 $11,301.00 $11,266.00 $10,890.00 $10,462.00

$14,244.00 $12,770.00 $10,552.00 $14,244.00 $12,770.00

$11,301.00 not purchased $10,890.00
13’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader $9,848.00 $12,041.00 $9,848.00 $11,930.00 $12,041.00 $9,848.00 $11,930.00 $12,041.00 $12,838.00 $9,848.00

$10,552.00 not purchased $12,770.00
16’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader $11,016.00 $12,121.00 $11,016.00 $13,319.00 $12,121.00 $11,016.00 $13,319.00 $12,121.00 $14,470.00 $11,016.00 not purchased $12,121.00
13’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader with Auger $10,552.00 $12,770.00 $10,552.00

not purchased ($4,830.00)
16’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader with Auger $12,504.00 $12,823.00 $12,504.00 $13,645.00 $12,823.00 $12,504.00 $13,645.00 $12,823.00 $15,200.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A  

$12,504.00 not purchased $12,823.00
10 Speed Manual Transmission ($5,282.00) ($5,282.00) ($5,500.00) ($5,500.00) ($5,500.00) ($5,500.00) ($5,500.00) ($5,500.00) N/A  ($4,821.00)

$64.00 not purchased $61.80
Pavement Temperature Sensor $1,471.00 $1,398.00 $1,471.00 $1,591.00 $1,398.00 $1,471.00 $1,591.00 $1,398.00 $1,360.00 $1,471.00 not purchased $1,398.00
Eaton Ultra Shift Transmission  (Based on) $1,983.00 $1,983.00 N/A N/A

Exhaust Brake Engine Retarder (Based on ISL) $2,274.00 $2,274.00 $430 Exhaust Brake or $805 
Compression Brake

$430 Exhaust Brake or $805 
Compression Brake

$430 Exhaust Brake or $805 
Compression Brake

$425 Exhaust Brake or $790 
Compression Brake

$425 Exhaust Brake or $790 
Compression Brake

$425 Exhaust Brake or $790 
Compression Brake

$425 Exhaust Brake or $790 
Compression Brake

$1,375.00 not purchased $1,375.00

Automatic Tire Chains $1,963.00 $1,843.00 $1,963.00 $2,163.00 $1,843.00 $1,963.00 $2,163.00 $1,843.00 $1,528.00 $1,963.00 not purchased $1,843.00
Dual Steering $0.00 N/A $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $8,190.00 $9,446.00 not purchased $9,446.00

not purchased STD
Dump Body Vibrator $939.00 $813.00 $939.00 $842.00 $813.00 $939.00 $842.00 $813.00 $529.00

$100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00

$939.00 not purchased $813.00
Cummins ISL9 Engine $0.00 $0.00 ($525.00) ($525.00) ($525.00) ($525.00) ($525.00) ($525.00) ($525.00)  

$156.00 not purchased $156.00
Passenger Door Peep Window $168.00 $168.00 $840.00 $840.00 $840.00 $840.00 $840.00 $840.00 $840.00 $160.00 not purchased $160.00
Bluetooth Hands-free Technology $300.00 $300.76 $100.00

not purchased ($1,235.00)
Tank Heater $438.00 $438.00 $670.00 $670.00 $670.00 $670.00 $670.00 $670.00 Included in Base

$918.00 $895.00 $973.00 $918.00 $895.00 $895.00

 not purchased N/A
Removal of Base Pre-Wet System from base unit. ($2,072.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,072.00) $1023.00 ($1,235.00) ($2,072.00) $1023.00 ($1,235.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,070.00)

$973.00 not purchased $895.00
Receiver Pintle Hitch per 2.6.5.r $75.00 $434.00 $75.00 $164.00 $434.00 $75.00 $164.00 $434.00 $434.00 $75.00 not purchased $434.00
Add 25 GPM Pre-Wet System per 2.6.5.o $973.00 $895.00 $973.00

not purchased $600.00
Walk Rail for Stainless Steel Bed $968.00 $876.00 $968.00 $724.00 $876.00 $968.00 $724.00 $876.00

$991.00 $720.00 $620.00 $991.00 $720.00 $720.00

$968.00 not purchased $876.00
Walk Rail for Corten Steel Bed $651.00 $600.00 $651.00 $414.00 $600.00 $651.00 $414.00 $600.00 $600.00 $615.00

$620.00 not purchased $605.00
Installation of MoDOT owned 50 Watt radio $192.00 $128.00 $237.00 $484.00 $190.00 $237.00 $484.00 $190.00 $137.50 $192.00 not purchased $128.00
Back Up Camera and Display $620.00 $605.00 $620.00

not purchased $389.00
Installation of MoDOT owned 100 Watt radio $192.00 $143.00 $237.00 $484.00 $205.00 $237.00 $484.00 $205.00 $154.00

$296.00 $242.00 $236.00 $296.00 $242.00 $242.00

$192.00 not purchased $143.00
Heated Windshield $425.00 $425.00 $494.00 $494.00 $494.00 $494.00 $494.00 $494.00 $494.00 $389.00

$236.00 not purchased $240.00
Lug Nut Torque Indicator $90.00 $92.00 $69.00 $186.00  $69.00 $186.00   $69.00 not purchased $180.00
Vibrating Wiper Blades $236.00 $240.00 $236.00

 not purchased N/A
Air Control Operated Tarp $1,130.00 $780.00 $1,130.00 $131.00 $780.00 $1,130.00 $131.00 $780.00 $780.00 $1,130.00 not purchased $780.00
Tire Pressure Monitoring System $1,333.00 $1,333.00 $2,434.00 $2,434.00

$0.00 $245.00 $0.00 $210.00 $245.00  $210.00 $245.00

$2,434.00 $2,434.00 $2,434.00 $2,434.00  

$79.00 $66.00

NC not purchased $245.00
Air Control Operated Tail Gate Latch $0.00 $66.00 $0.00 $52.00 $66.00  $52.00 $66.00 NC not purchased $66.00
Air Operated Hydraulic Joy Stick Control Lever

$1,963.00 not purchased $66.00
Additional Training Modules $0.00 Nav.$3,000 12Hrs Nav.$3,000 12Hrs Nav.$3,000 12Hrs Nav.$3,000 12Hrs Nav.$3,000 12Hrs Nav.$3,000 12Hrs Nav. $3,000 12Hrs/ $200 

Viking
NC not purchased $600.00

Air Control Operated Tire Chains $1,963.00 $66.00 $1,963.00 $79.00 $66.00 $1,963.00

not purchased $822.00
Installation of MoDOT Provided Decals $122.00 $36.00 $118.00 $47.00 $36.00 $122.00 $47.00 $36.00 $36.00

$77.00 $49.00 $41.00 $77.00 $49.00 $49.00

$122.00 not purchased $36.00
Shovel Tool Box $768.00 $822.00 $746.00 $1020.00 $822.00 $768.00 $1020.00 $822.00 $768.00

$41.00 not purchased $49.00
Remove base spreader control and replace with Rexroth CS 550/150 Spreader /Joy 
Stick Controller.

($1,630.00) ($654.00) ($1,630.00) No Bid ($654.00) ($1,630.00) No Bid ($654.00) ($1,630.00)  not purchased ($654.00)
Stainless Steel Spring Loaded Shovel Bracket $41.00 $49.00 $40.00

not purchased $2,238.00
13-foot Spreader Stand $1,937.00 $2,178.00 $1,881.00 $2,889.00 $2,178.00 $1,937.00 $2,889.00 $2,178.00 $2,095.00

($2,188.00) $2,953.00 $1,767.00 ($2,188.00) $2,953.00

$1,937.00 not purchased $2,178.00
16-foot Spreader Stand $2,063.00 $2,239.00 $2,003.00 $3,264.00 $2,239.00 $2,063.00 $3,264.00 $2,239.00 $2,284.00 $2,063.00

$1,767.00 not purchased $2,953.00

Remove base spreader control & replace w/Cirus Controls SpreadSmart RX CAN Bus
Spreader Control System

($804.00) $1,281.00 ($804.00) ($1,475.00) $1,293.00 ($804.00) ($1,475.00) $1,293.00 ($804.00) not purchased $1,293.00

Remove base spreader control and replace w/Force America CANBus Spreader 
Control System

$1,767.00 $2,953.00 $1,716.00



TANDEM AXLE PRICE AND INFORMATION

Tandem Axle Cab and Chassis $96,150.00 $94,997.00 
Tandem Axle Corten V-Style Long Sill Dump Body $48,801.00 $53,322.00 
Tandem Axle Stainless Steel I-Beam Long Sill dump Body $51,322.00 $58,370.00 
Tandem Axle Extended Warranty Option #1 $3,126.00 $3,552.00 
Right and/or Left Hand Wing Plow $8,940.00 $8,961.00 
HD Right Hand 3 Function Front Mount Wing Plow $12,123.00 $13,584.00 
Underbody Scraper $11,301.00 $11,266.00 
13’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader $9,848.00 $11,930.00 
13’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader with Auger $10,552.00 $14,244.00 
16’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader $11,016.00 $13,319.00 
16’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader with Auger $12,504.00 $13,645.00 
10 Speed Manual Transmission ($6,338.00) ($4,912.00)
Eaton Ultra Shift Transmission  (Based on) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Pavement Temperature Sensor $1,471.00 $1,591.00 
Exhaust Brake Engine Retarder (Based on ISL) $301.00 $208.00 

Automatic Tire Chains $1,963.00 $2,163.00 
Dual Steering N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Dump Body Vibrator $939.00 $842.00
Cummins ISL9 Engine N/A N/A N/A
Bluetooth Hands-free Technology $0.00  
Passenger Door Peep Window
Tank Heater N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $300.00 
Removal of Base Pre-Wet System from base unit. ($2,072.00) $1,023.00 
Add 25 GPM Pre-Wet System per 2.6.5.o $973.00 $918.00 
Receiver Pintle Hitch per 2.6.5.r $75.00 $164.00 
Walk Rail for Stainless Steel Bed $968.00 $724.00 
Walk Rail for Corten Steel Bed $651.00 $414.00 
Back Up Camera and Display $620.00 $991.00 
Installation of MoDOT owned 50 Watt radio $192.00 $430.00 
Installation of MoDOT owned 100 Watt radio $192.00 $430.00 
Heated Windshield $421.00 $290.00 
Vibrating Wiper Blades $236.00 N/A N/A
Lug Nut Torque Indicator $69.00 $186.00
Tire Pressure Monitoring System $1,230.00 N/A N/A
Air Control Operated Tarp $1,130.00 $131.00 
Air Operated Hydraulic Joy Stick Control Lever $0.00 $210.00 
Air Control Operated Tail Gate Latch $0.00 $52.00 
Air Control Operated Tire Chains $1,963.00 $79.00 
Additional Training Modules $308.00

Installation of MoDOT Provided Decals $122.00 $47.00 
Shovel Tool Box $768.00 $1,020.00 
Stainless Steel Spring Loaded Shovel Bracket $41.00 $77.00 
Remove base spreader control and replace with Rexroth CS 550/150 Spreader 
/Joy Stick Controller

($1,630.00)

13-foot Spreader Stand $1,937.00 $2,889.00 
16-foot Spreader Stand $2,063.00 $3,264.00 
Remove base spreader control and replace w/Force America CANBus Spreader 
Control

$1,767.00 ($2,188.00)

Remove base spreader control & replace w/Cirus Controls SpreadSmart RX
CAN Bus Spreader Control System

($804.00) ($1,475.00)

Vanguard GU4 
w/Henderson

Vanguard GU7 
w/Henderson

Vanguard GU4 
w/Monroe

Vanguard GU7 
w/Monroe

Vanguard GU4 
w/Viking

Vanguard GU7 w/Viking Westfall GMC Mack 
Granite 
w/Henderson

Westfall GMC Mack 
MHD w/Henderson

Westfall GMC Mack 
Granite w/Monroe

Westfall GMC Mack MHD 
w/Monroe

Westfall GMC Mack 
Granite w/Viking

Westfall GMC Mack MHD 
w/Viking

$96,412.00 $96,150.00 $96,412.00 $96,150.00 $96,412.00 $96,707.00 $94,997.00 $96,707.00 $96,774.00 $95,064.00 
$48,801.00 $53,322.00 $53,322.00 $49,498.00 $48,926.00 $48,801.00 $48,801.00 $53,322.00 $48,926.00 $48,926.00 
$51,322.00 $58,370.00 $58,370.00 $51,965.00 $51,381.00 $51,322.00 $51,322.00 $58,370.00 $51,381.00 $51,381.00 
$4,865.00 $3,126.00 $4,865.00 $3,126.00 $4,865.00 $4,059.00 $3,552.00 $4,059.00 $4,059.00 $3,552.00 
$8,940.00 $8,961.00 $8,961.00 $8,922.00 $8,922.00 $8,940.00 $8,940.00 $8,961.00 $8,922.00 $8,922.00 
$12,123.00 $13,584.00 $13,584.00 $12,041.00 $12,041.00 $12,123.00 $12,123.00 $13,584.00 $12,627.00 $12,627.00 
$11,301.00 $11,266.00 $11,266.00 $10,890.00 $10,890.00 $11,301.00 $11,301.00 $11,266.00 $10,890.00 $10,890.00 
$9,848.00 $11,930.00 $11,930.00 $12,041.00 $12,041.00 $9,848.00 $9,848.00 $11,930.00 $12,041.00 $12,041.00 
$10,552.00 $14,244.00 $14,244.00 $12,770.00 $12,770.00 $10,552.00 $10,552.00 $14,244.00 $12,770.00 $12,770.00 
$11,016.00 $13,319.00 $13,319.00 $12,121.00 $12,121.00 $11,016.00 $11,016.00 $13,319.00 $12,121.00 $12,121.00 
$12,504.00 $13,645.00 $13,645.00 $12,823.00 $12,823.00 $12,504.00 $12,504.00 $13,645.00 $12,823.00 $12,823.00 
($3,953.00) ($6,338.00) ($3,953.00) ($6,338.00) ($3,953.00) ($6,931.00) ($4,912.00) ($6,931.00) ($6,931.00) ($4,912.00)

Not Available N/A N/A N/A N/A
$1,471.00   $1,398.00 $1,398.00 $1,471.00 $1,471.00 $1,544.00 $1,398.00 $1,398.00 
$301.00 $301.00 $301.00 $301.00 $301.00 $144.00 $208.00 $144.00 $144.00 $208.00 

$1,963.00 $2,163.00 $2,163.00 $1,843.00 $1,843.00 $1,963.00 $1,963.00 $2,060.00 $1,843.00 $1,843.00 
Not Available N/A N/A N/A N/A

$939.00 $842.00 $842.00 $813.00 $813.00 $939.00 $939.00 $842.00 $813.00 $813.00
Included Included Included Not Available Standard N/A Standard N/A Standard

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00   Standard  Standard Standard  StandardStandard Standard
Included Included Included Included Included included Standard Standard Standard Standard Standard Standard

Not Available $290.00 $300.00 $290.00 $290.00 $300.00 
($2,072.00) $1023.00 $1023.00 ($1,235.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,072.00) ($2,072.00) $1,023.00 ($1,235.00) ($1,235.00)
$973.00 $918.00 $918.00 $895.00 $895.00 $973.00 $973.00 $918.00 $895.00 $895.00 
$75.00 $164.00 $164.00 $434.00 $434.00 $75.00 $75.00 $164.00 $434.00 $434.00 
$968.00 $724.00 $724.00 $876.00 $876.00 $968.00 $968.00 $724.00 $876.00 $876.00 
$651.00 $414.00 $414.00 $600.00 $600.00 $651.00 $651.00 $414.00 $600.00 $600.00 
$620.00 $991.00 $991.00 $605.00 $605.00 $620.00 $620.00 $991.00 $285.00 $605.00 
$192.00 $430.00 $430.00 $128.00 $128.00 $192.00 $192.00 $430.00 $128.00 $128.00 
$192.00 $430.00 $430.00 $143.00 $143.00 $192.00 $192.00 $430.00 $143.00 $143.00 
$421.00 $421.00 $421.00 $421.00 $421.00 $278.00 $290.00 $278.00 $278.00 $290.00 
$236.00 $240.00 $240.00 $236.00 $236.00 N/A N/A $240.00 $240.00 
$69.00 $186.00 $186.00 $120.00 $120.00 $69.00 $69.00 $186.00
$1,230.00 $1,230.00 $1,230.00 $1,230.00 $1,230.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
$1,130.00 $131.00 $131.00 $780.00 $780.00 $1,130.00 $1,130.00 $131.00 $780.00 $780.00 
$0.00 $210.00 $210.00 $245.00 $245.00 $0.00 $0.00 $210.00 $245.00 $245.00 
$0.00 $52.00 $52.00 $66.00 $66.00 $0.00 $0.00 $52.00 $66.00 $66.00 
$1,963.00 $79.00 $79.00 $66.00 $66.00 $1,963.00 $1,963.00 $79.00 $66.00 $66.00 
$308.00 $308 / $600 $308 / $600 $308 / $204 $308 / $204 0 0

$122.00 $47.00 $47.00 $36.00 $36.00 $122.00 $122.00 $47.00 $36.00 $36.00 

$49.00 
$768.00 $1020.00 $1020.00 $822.00 $822.00 $768.00 $768.00 $1,020.00 $822.00 $822.00 

NO BID ($654.00)
$41.00 $77.00 $77.00 $49.00 $49.00 $41.00 $41.00 $77.00 $49.00 

($654.00)

$1,937.00 $2,889.00 $2,889.00 $2,178.00 $2,178.00 $1,937.00 $1,937.00 $2,889.00 $2,178.00 $2,178.00 

($1,630.00) NO BID NO BID ($654.00) ($654.00) ($1,630.00) ($1,630.00) NO BID

$2,063.00 $3,264.00 $3,264.00 $2,239.00 $2,239.00 $2,063.00 $2,063.00 $3,264.00 $2,239.00 $2,239.00 
$1,767.00 ($2,188.00) ($2,188.00) $2,953.00 $2,953.00 $1,767.00 $1,767.00 ($2,188.00) $2,953.00 $2,953.00 

($804.00) ($1,475.00) ($1,475.00) $1,293.00 $1,293.00 ($804.00) ($804.00) ($1,475.00) $1,293.00 $1,293.00 


